Bid Tabulation Form

Project Identification Number: EX0.20.028 Bids Opened and Read By: David Trudeau
Project Name: Earthwork Term Contract Bids Recorded and Tabulated By: Kasey Donahue
Contract Identification Number: EX0.20.028.001 Bid Opening Date: 6-May-2021
Contract Name: Excavation & Grading for Electrical Infrastructure Term Contract Bid Opening Time: 10:00 AM
Contractor Bid Item Bid Amount Addendum Acknowled, t [OEPC-3
Total Unit Price Bid - Belleayre
Ski Mt. Center $144,895.00
Total Unit Price Bid - Gore Ski
Hubble Inc Mt. Center No Bid
PO Box 664 Total Unit Price Bid - Olympic Ski
46124 State Highway 30 Jumps No Bid
Margaretville, NY 12455 . _ _
Total Unit Price Bid - Olympic
Sports Complex No Bid
Total Unit Price Bid - Whiteface V
Ski Center No Bid
Total Unit Price Bid - Belleayre
Ski Mt. Center No Bid
Total Unit Price Bid - Gore Ski
Mt. Center $411,856.00
Cutting Edge Group, LLC
PO Box 733 Total Unit Price Bid - Olympic Ski
Lake George, NY 12845 Jumps $413,856.00
Total Unit Price Bid - Olympic
Sports Complex $413,856.00
Total Unit Price Bid - Whiteface V
Ski Center $413,856.00
Total Unit Price Bid - Belleayre
Ski Mt. Center $491,729.70
Total Unit Price Bid - Gore Ski
Mt. Center $447,027.00
G.W. Tatro Construction NY
16 GW Tatro Drive Total Unit Price Bid - Olympic Ski
Jeffersonville, VT 05464 Jumps $447,027.00
Total Unit Price Bid - Olympic
Sports Complex $447,027.00
Total Unit Price Bid - Whiteface V
Ski Center $447,027.00
Total Unit Price Bid - Belleayre
Ski Mt. Center $171,195.50
Total Unit Price Bid - Gore Ski
Farmer Boy Restoration & M. Center $159,830.50
Environmental, LLC Total Unit Price Bid - Olympic Ski
238 Sunset Road Jumps $158,802.50
Canton, PA 17724 . _ _
Total Unit Price Bid - Olympic
Sports Complex $158,802.50
Total Unit Price Bid - Whiteface V
Ski Center $160,120.50
Total Unit Price Bid - Belleayre
Ski Mt. Center $463,980.00
Total Unit Price Bid - Gore Ski
Mt. Center $448,166.00
Zielinkski's Inc
PO Box 841 Total Unit Price Bid - Olympic Ski
Au Sable Forks, NY 12912 Jumps $417,178.00
Total Unit Price Bid - Olympic
Sports Complex $417,178.00
Total Unit Price Bid - Whiteface V
Ski Center $414,942.00
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